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Statement of the Ahmadiyya Muslim Community on Recent
Escalations in the Israeli and Palestinian conflict
Note:

The following statement is published according to the guidance of the Worldwide Head of
the Ahmadiyya Muslim Community, His Holiness, Hazrat Mirza Masroor Ahmad.

Statement on behalf of the Ahmadiyya Muslim Community:



“Over the past few days, hundreds of Israelis and Palestinians, including women,
children and the elderly, have been killed or injured as a result of senseless violence
and bloodshed. The killing or harming of innocent civilians is a direct violation of the
teachings of the Holy Prophet of Islam (peace and blessings be upon him), who
taught that even in a state of warfare, no woman, child or elder should be targeted or
harmed in any way. Nor should any religious leader or place of worship be attacked.

The Ahmadiyya Muslim Community extends its deepest sympathies and prayers to
all those who have been left bereaved or affected in any way. Our hearts go out to
them all.

We pray and urge for an immediate end to hostilities and for peace to prevail so that
no more lives are lost. For that, it is necessary that the channels of communication
between relevant parties and nations remain open.

Until a ceasefire occurs, any military action taken must ensure that civilians do not
come to any harm.

Furthermore, Muslim countries within the region should unite in an effort to establish
peace and to ensure that the rights of those innocent Palestinian people, who have
no link with extremists, are protected.

We urge the United States and other influential nations to abstain from any actions or
statements that may further inflame the volatile situation. Instead, alongside the
relevant international organisations, they should make every possible effort to
urgently de-escalate the conflict and secure peace as soon as possible.

Justice and equity are of paramount importance in achieving lasting and sustainable
peace. Thus, all the major powers must focus on establishing long-term and
sustainable peace based upon the principles of fairness and true justice.
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